



Atchison County Commission Meeting

Atchison County Courthouse
Lower Level
423 North 5th St
Atchison, KS 66002
March 29, 2022
REGULAR MEETING AGENDA
Starting at 1:00 pm
Chairman Eric Noll, 2nd District

Commissioner Jack Bower, 1st District

Commissioner Casey Quinn, 3rd District

1. 1:00 P.M. ZOOM MEETING ID # 819 3983 4383
2. Call To Order
The County Commission is called to order by the Chairman
3. Pledge Of Allegiance
4. Public Comment
5. Reading And Approval Of Minutes
Approval of Minutes from Last commission meeting
- 5.1. Approved 03/29/2022 Atchison County Commission Meeting Minutes
Documents:
[03-29-2022.PDF](#)
6. Commissioner Comments And Committee Reports
7. Reports Of Elected Officials And Department Heads
8. New Business Before The Board
- 8.1. Joe Snyder, Road & Bridge Superintendent
Bid Opening for 2022 Chemical Bids
- 8.2. Joe Snyder, Road & Bridge Superintendent
Purchase Order Approval to Little Joe's Asphalt
- 8.3. Joe Snyder, Road & Bridge Superintendent
Purchase Order Approval to Vance Brothers

9. Old Or Unfinished Business Before The Board
10. County Counselor Updates
11. Executive Sessions (Time Reserved For Executive Sessions)
12. Presentation And Approval Of Claims
13. Presentation Of Petitions, Memorials, And Remonstrances
14. Introduction And Consideration Of Resolutions
15. Notices And Communications
16. Public Comment
17. Adjournment
18. Zoom Details

Atchison County will be limiting public access to all Atchison County departments and offices to take preventative measures designed to reduce the spread of the Coronavirus illness. We are making arrangements to adjust services to be in the best interest of the employees and citizens of Atchison County and following the interim guidance as provided by KDHE and the CDC. The Atchison County Board of County Commission meetings will be utilizing Zoom to meet the Kansas Open Meetings Act. Members of the public can connect to the meetings via smart phone, or computer connections. The meeting ID number will be listed on the corresponding agenda. Members of the public can attend the BOCC meeting in-person; however, we urge and encourage all citizens to take active steps to prevent the spread of COVID-19. If you have any symptoms similar to the flu, including fever, cough or shortness of breath, please do not attend until symptoms have subsided and you have been fever-free for 24 hours. |

Tuesday, March 29, 2022

Pursuant to the law, the Atchison County Commission Board met in Regular Session at 1:00 PM at the Atchison County Courthouse, Lower Level, 423 N 5th St., Atchison, KS. A link to the meeting was made available to the public prior to the meeting. In addition, public attendance was available for the Commission meeting at the Atchison County Courthouse, Lower Level, 423 N 5th St., Atchison, KS. Chairman Eric Noll called the meeting to order with Commissioner Casey Quinn, Commissioner Jack Bower, and County Counselor Patrick Henderson present for the meeting. Kalee Vanderweide, Deputy County Election Officer recorded the minutes.

The Board recited the pledge of allegiance to start the meeting.

***Public Comment:**

There were no public comments.

***Reading and Approval of Minutes:**

Minutes of the March 22, 2022 meeting were reviewed with no corrections noted. Commissioner Quinn made the motion to approve the minutes as presented. Chairman Noll seconded the motion. Chairman Noll called for a vote. The motion passed 2-0, with Commissioner Bower abstaining.

***Commissioner Comments and Committee Reports**

Commissioner Quinn stated the Sports Complex Town Hall on Tuesday, March 22, 2022, went great.

Commissioner Quinn stated that she went to a Wind Energy Presentation with Michelle Phillips, County Clerk, on Monday, March 28, 2022.

Commissioner Quinn stated this Thursday, March 31, 2022, at Paolucci's is a meet and greet for Atchison Senior Village administration.

***New Business Before the Board:**

Kim Pruett, Joint Communication Director, appeared before the Board with a purchase order to Kastens Plumbing & Heating, Inc., to replace the north unit with new heating/cooling Marvail Unit, in the amount of \$8,338.00. Commissioner Bower made a motion to accept the purchase order to Kastens Plumbing & Heating, Inc., in the amount of \$8,338.00. Commissioner Quinn seconded the motion. Chairman Noll called for a vote, all voted aye. The motion passed 3-0.

Kim Glover, Noxious Weed Director, appeared before the Board to open the 2022 Chemical Bids. The two bids received are as follows:

Nutrien Solutions			
Chemical Name	Brand Name	Price/Gal	Total/Cost
Imitator Plus	Makaze-LPI	\$ 42.00	\$ 1,680.00
Tordon 22K RUP	Tordon 22k-Corteva	\$ 42.50	\$ 5,312.50
Feelexx	Freelexx-Corteva	\$ 25.50	\$ 7,650.00
Remedy Ultra	Remedy Ultra-Corteva	\$ 49.75	\$ 7,462.50
2, 4-D Amine 4LB Acid	Platoon-Nufarm	\$ 24.50	\$ 7,350.00
Gardian Weathermax	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Weather Gard Complete	Weathergard Complete-LPI	\$ 22.00	\$ 550.00
Escort XP	Escort XP-Bayer	\$ 2.07	\$ 215.28
			\$30,220.28
Van Diest			
Chemical Name	Brand Name	Price/Gal	Total/Cost
Imitator Plus-Ranger Pro	Bayer 604810	\$ 35.80	\$ 1,432.00
Tordon 22K RUP	Corteva 705877	\$ 43.75	\$ 5,468.75
Feelexx	Corteva 356109	\$ 25.50	\$ 7,650.00
Remedy Ultra	Corteva 611577	\$ 55.08	\$ 8,262.00
2, 4-D Amine 4LB Acid	Cornbelt 781210	\$ 16.80	\$ 5,040.00
Gardian Weathermax	Cornbelt 351808	\$ 20.52	\$ 513.00
Weather Gard Complete	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Escort XP	Bayer 314177	\$ 2.13	\$ 213.00
			\$28,578.75

Director Glover will come back at a later date with her recommendation.

Joe Snyder, Road & Bridge Superintendent, appeared before the Board with a purchase order to Little Joe's Asphalt, Inc., for the 2022 Surface Milling & Patching – County Wide, in the amount of \$220,302.00. Commissioner Bower made a motion to approve the purchase order to Little Joe's Asphalt, Inc., in the amount of \$220,302.00. Commissioner Quinn seconded the motion. Chairman Noll called for a vote, all voted aye. The motion passed 3-0.

Superintendent Snyder appeared before the Board with a purchase order to Vance Brothers, for the Morton Road Microsurfacing Wedge Course only, in the amount of \$220,302.00. Commissioner Bower made a motion to approve the purchase order to Little Joe's Asphalt, Inc., in the amount of \$59,093.50. Commissioner Quinn seconded the motion. Chairman Noll called for a vote, all voted aye. The motion passed 3-0.

***County Counselor Updates:**

Patrick Henderson, County Counselor, stated he is working on an invitation to bid on real estate for Sherman Road. Counselor Henderson stated he is waiting on title report and he will present the invitation to bid next week.

***Executive Session:**

Commissioner Quinn moved that the Board of County Commissioners recess into executive session at 1:15 pm for consultation with an attorney for the public body which would be deemed privileged in the attorney-client relationship, as allowed by K.S.A. 75-

4319(b) (2), and that the purpose of the closed session is to protect confidentiality of the discussion, and that the Board come out of the executive session at 1:30 pm, in the commission room, lower level, courthouse. Those present will be: the three commissioners and County Counselor Patrick Henderson. Commissioner Bower second the motion. Chairman Noll called for a vote, all voted aye. The motion passed 3-0.

***Public Comment:**

There were no public comments.

Add, abate, escapes for real estate and personal property taxes were presented to be approved.

Bills were presented to be signed.

Commissioner Bower made the motion to adjourn at 1:30 pm. Commissioner Quinn seconded the motion. Chairman Noll called for a vote, all voted aye. The motion passed 3-0.

*Note: Once approved these minutes will be the official minutes of the Board of County Commissioners. Regular meetings of the Board of County Commissioners are video-recorded. The video of these meeting is generally available for supplementation of the minutes. The videos can be located under the Government tab at www.atchisoncountyks.org.

Attest: Kalee Vanderweide, Deputy County Election Officer